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ABSTRACT 

This study aims to identify the characteristics of liabilities and contingencies of 20 clubs 
participating in the First and Second Division of the Brazilian Championship of 2017 that 
presented all financial statements from 2010 to 2018. It was found that 79 of 180 balance 
sheets analyzed presented uncovered liabilities and denoting effective problems of 
economic and financial unviability although no clubs broke effectively. The findings 
demonstrate that clubs cannot support themselves and eventually need to raise third-party 
resources. The study differs from previous research because it identifies the characteristics 
of liabilities, and provisions as present and future obligations for Brazilian football clubs. 
Thus, this research contributes by providing an overview of the indebtedness of Brazilian 
football clubs. 
Keywords: contingencies; football; liabilities; provisions; obligations. 

 
RESUMO 

Este estudo busca identificar as características dos passivos e contingências dos 20 clubes 
das séries A e B do Campeonato Brasileiro de 2017 que apresentaram as demonstrações 
contábeis de 2010 a 2018. Foi verificado que dos 180 balanços analisados, 79 apresentaram 
passivo a descoberto denotando problemas efetivos de inviabilidade econômico-financeira 
embora nenhum clube tenha quebrado efetivamente. Os achados demonstram que os 
clubes não conseguem se sustentar com recursos próprios e necessitam, eventualmente, 
captar recursos com terceiros. O estudo se diferencia de pesquisas anteriores porque 
identifica as características das obrigações presentes e futuras dos clubes de futebol 
brasileiros. 
Palavras-chave: contingências; futebol; passivos; provisões; obrigações. 

 
RESUMEN 

Este estudio busca identificar las características de los pasivos y contingencias de los 20 
clubes de las series A y B del Campeonato Brasileño 2017 que presentaron los estados 
financieros de 2010 a 2018. Se encontró que, de los 180 balances analizados, 79 tenían 
pasivos no garantizados que denotan problemas reales de inviabilidad económica y 
financiera, aunque ningún club se ha derrumbado efectivamente. Los hallazgos demuestran 
que los clubes no pueden mantenerse a sí mismos con sus propios recursos y necesitan 
recaudar fondos de terceros. El estudio se diferencia de investigaciones anteriores porque 
identifica las características de las obligaciones presentes y futuras de los clubes de fútbol 
brasileños. 
Palabras clave: contingencias; fútbol; pasivo; provisiones; obligaciones. 
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1 INTRODUCTION 

 

Debts in professional sports is increasingly common, 

especially in football clubs. Club indebtedness has gained 

attention due to the increase in debts to cover short-term 

obligations and constraints associated with this situation 

such as poor performance, loosing fans and sponsors, less 

chances of winning tournaments, consequently, reducing 

revenues and the liquidity capacity (Mourão, 2012). In 

Brazil, the economic scenario of football is worrisome. In 

2014 the Brazilian clubs’ debts exceeded R$ 6 billion 

(Mattos, 2014; Pamplona, 2015), and the obligations with 

social security charges of the clubs that participated in First 

Division of the Brazilian Championship of 2008 exceeded 

R$ 150 million (Rezende & Dalmácio, 2015). Between 2010 

and 2013 the average indebtedness rate was 100% for 33 

clubs (Dantas et al., 2017), while between 2012 and 2016 

the consolidated indebtedness of Brazilian clubs increased 

by 28% (Ambrósio et al., 2017).  

Furthermore, the importance given to the subject is 

still seen in the media. Reports such as Cassucci (2020), 

Fagiolo (2020) and GloboEsporte.com (2020) address the 

debt size of Brazilian teams by checking some of the 

balance sheets published for the 2019 financial year. In 

some cases, they point to growth or compare them with 

revenues, as is the case of Sport, which has R$ 145 million 

to be paid in 2020 but estimates a net revenue of R$ 61 

million. In addition, the clubs in the First Division in 2017 and 

the Sport Club Internacional accumulated together 3,037 

lawsuits in labor courts by August 2017, totaling R$ 2.4 

billion, representing 38% of the clubs’ total liabilities in 2016 

(Mundim, 2017). 

There are several justifications for the problem faced 

by Brazilian clubs. Studies (such as Barajas & Rodríguez, 

2013; Beech et al., 2010; Morrow, 2013; Scelles et al., 2018; 

Szymanski & Weimar, 2017) point out that what causes 

clubs to become financially unsustainable is the excess 

spending to win championships, as they invest beyond their 

resources to achieve sporting success, even though this is 

an uncertain result. Because the uncertainty, sports results 

may not be achieved and the expectations of resources tied 

to it may not be realized, impacting the clubs' economic and 

financial situation (Storm & Thomsen, 2016), reducing their 

budget. 

González, Fernández, and Suárez (2018) see this 

situation as a vicious cycle, a greater financial effort is made 

to improve sports results as opposed to maximizing cost-

benefit, so the result is an increase in indebtedness. 

Considering that there is no optimal capital structure that 

defines the best way for an entity to raise funds (Dantas et 

al., 2017), and that the level of debt of Brazilian clubs has 

been increasing over the years, it is important to understand 

what makes up this debt. Although there is a demand to 

know about the Brazilian football clubs’ debt situation, there 

are few studies discussing their capital structure, such as 

the work by Dantas et al. (2017), which observes the need 

to know the liabilities of the Brazilian clubs. Therefore, this 

study aims to identify the characteristics of liabilities and 

contingencies of Brazilian football clubs. 

Discussion are increasingly frequent in the Brazilian 

football scene due to the increase of the clubs’ debts (such 

as Capelo, 2016; Cassucci, 2020; Fagiolo, 2020; Mattos, 

2014; Mundim, 2017; Pamplona, 2015). They seek to 

identify the main points of the clubs’ indebtedness and the 

need to understand this situation. In this sense, this study is 

justified as an attempt to explain the profile of the 

obligations, since, when analyzing the liabilities and 

contingencies of these organizations, it is possible to obtain 

an overview of the sector, allowing to evaluate the economic 

and financial situation and to make projections. 

Nonetheless, members, fans, investors, 

governments, and society should be aware of the clubs’ 

indebtedness since this issue represents large money 

transactions involving taxpayers’ money. Recently, the 

Brazilian bank Caixa Econômica Federal considered the 

possibility of default of the Sport Club Corinthians Paulista 

on loan payments regarding the construction of its stadium. 

The bank assigned an “E” rating to the club in the face of 

continued contract breaches and discovering that the 

current cash flow of the club is insufficient to meet its 

obligations (Garcia et al., 2018). In addition to the execution 

of club’s debt through the attachment of its assets, it is 

possible that the organization is challenged in court, so that 

the increase in contingencies can be verified should the 

situation of default persist. Situations such as these 

reinforce the importance and necessity of studying their 

contingencies as they can shape future debts and 

significantly affect the organizations’ financial structure. 

In this sense, it is necessary to understand and 

improve not only the management of Brazilian football, but 

also to understand how the clubs’ debts are formed and 

managed, since, for the most part, they are unsustainable 

and capable of deteriorating the value of market and the 

added value of the football market (Mourão, 2012). 

Furthermore, it is justified by its focus on showing how the 

clubs 'debt is structured, pointing out their sources of 

financing, because, before understanding what determines 

the teams' indebtedness, it is necessary to understand how 

it is composed. This fact is what differentiates this study from 

others (such as Cunha et al., 2017; Dantas et al., 2017; 

Mourão, 2012). 

This study promotes the discussion on football 

finances, addressing an environment recognized worldwide 

for the quality of sports practice and marked by economic 

and financial problems, but still poorly explored 

academically. Thus, it contributes to filling the gap in the 

literature, considering that the research focuses on the 

European context (Barajas & Rodríguez, 2010, 2013; Beech 

et al., 2010; Dietl & Franck, 2007; Dimitropoulos, 2014; 

Mourão, 2012; Scelles et al., 2018; Szymanski, 2017). In 
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Brazil, the sports literature gives greater emphasis on 

studies on disclosure (Rezende & Custódio, 2012), 

efficiency (Dantas et al., 2015, 2016; Dantas & Boente, 

2011), capital structure (P. R. da Cunha et al., 2017) and 

indebtedness (Brandão, 2012; Dantas et al., 2017), without 

drawing a profile of the clubs' present and future debts. For 

the area, the study contributes to provide insights to 

regulators regarding the formulation of strategies to contain 

the growth of debts, standards to promote transparency and 

assist in the disclosure of quality accounting information to 

all stakeholders. 

 

2 FOOTBALL DEBT OF FOOTBALL CLUBS 

 

Debt in professional sports is a problem greatly 

affecting football clubs, which can be evidenced by the 

frequent mention of debt increase and consequent financing 

difficulties. The cause is justified by institutional issues, 

influence of the media or financial factors. In addition, the 

indebtedness may originate and increase from the need to 

raise funds from third parties, funds that end up not being 

sufficient to cover the clubs´ existing debts (Mourão, 2012) 

or consequences of sports performance.  

Behavioral forces such as the media, pressure and 

high wages affect football club debt. Clubs that increase 

their debts faster than their incomes become unsustainable 

and enter a cycle of spending (Dietl & Franck, 2007). This is 

reinforced when researchers (such as Rezende & Dalmácio, 

2015, p. 112) say “the search for better players and, 

therefore, the hope for better performance has led clubs to 

serious indebtedness”. One of the main factors related to 

the football clubs’ debt is the high salary (and related 

charges) of players hired to increase the clubs´ 

competitiveness (Barajas & Rodríguez, 2013; Dantas & 

Boente, 2011; Scelles et al., 2018). In addition, for clubs to 

cope with the business model practiced by most of the 

football teams, hiring renowned managers is essential. This 

raises staff costs, leading to debt increase if good resource 

management is not carried out (Mourão, 2012). When 

personnel expenses approach club operating income is a 

sign of poor management (Gutiérrez-Fernández et al., 

2017).  

Although the level of debt may restrict the availability 

of cash flows, business managers are led to form a capital 

structure that maximizes their own interests, without any 

stakeholder constraints, to the extent that a business is at 

risk of bankruptcy. When it comes to football clubs, this risk, 

however, is almost non-existent, because the possibilities to 

discontinue activities are low due to the various 

stakeholders who are always able to help in times of crisis. 

Thus, managers have no restrictions on establishing capital 

structure (Dimitropoulos, 2014). This situation may create 

conflicts of interest and increase club debt (Beech et al., 

2010), in a context where there is no pressure on managers, 

profitability is not a goal and monitoring of managerial 

activities is almost non-existent (Dantas et al., 2017). 

Brazilian teams are indebted for different reasons, 

such as mismanagement and government measures that 

divide the fiscal debts of clubs in the long term (Brandão, 

2012). In addition, activities are not separated according to 

the football or social departments, which can generate 

unnecessary debts. This may be one of the reasons why 

Brazilian football clubs have not yet professionalized 

management (Mattar, 2014). 

The problems affecting the debt payment is the 

inability to properly predict revenues, as clubs need to deal 

with the possibility of selling players during the season and 

the risk of being relegated to an inferior division of the 

tournaments (Proni & Zaia, 2014). Therefore, if revenues 

are not planned sufficiently, the likelihood of delays in debt 

payments increases. The access-relegation system of 

European competitions is pointed out by Scelles et al. 

(2018) as one of the reasons for clubs' high indebtedness. 

This is the system adopted in some Brazilian football 

competitions. Alm and Storm (2019) also consider the 

structure of competitions harmful to clubs, due to the small 

differences in sports results that can affect the income and 

planning of the teams. 

Debt increase in football clubs can also be explained 

by other sports variables. Winning clubs tend to have higher 

debt (Mourão, 2012, Dantas et al., 2017), because in order 

to win titles and improve image in the media and to increase 

revenues, the teams invest heavily to hire players, which 

does not guarantee results and ends up increasing debt. 

Studies dealing with the capital structure, debt, 

liabilities, and contingencies in football clubs are scarce in 

the Brazilian and international literature. One of them 

analyzed the explanatory factors of the debt of the main 

Brazilian football clubs, identifying that for total 

indebtedness, as fixed assets increase, the percentage of 

debt reduces, as well as an improvement in the operating 

result improves in the debt rates. The same was verified for 

bank debt (Brandão, 2012). Another study identified the 

factors that affected the debt of Portuguese clubs between 

seasons 1999/00 to 2005/06. The findings indicate that the 

higher the value of fixed assets, the greater the debt. The 

geographic location of the club and the salary costs also 

negatively influence the debt rate (Mourão, 2012). 

The impact of Corporate Governance on the capital 

structure of 67 European football clubs was evaluated and 

identified that governance mechanisms such as increased 

size and independence of boards, and a more fragmented 

property structure are capable of reducing debt 

(Dimitropoulos, 2014). Another study showed the 

explanatory factors of the capital structure of Brazilian 

football clubs in 2015. The findings identified that the larger 

the team and the more profitable it is, the lower the debt. 

The contrary was observed  for tangibility (P. R. da Cunha 

et al., 2017). 
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The influence of financial and sports factors on 

Brazilian football clubs also was verified. For the sample of 

33 clubs, they found that as size and profitability increase, 

indebtedness decreases. The opposite was verified for the 

relation between debt and total assets. The authors also 

observed that the fact that a club is in the First Division of 

the Brazilian Championship and/or one of the 12 largest 

clubs in Brazil is a preponderant factor for increased debt 

(Dantas et al., 2017). 

The determinants of provisions and contingent 

liabilities of football clubs in the Serie A of the Brazilian 

Championship between 2014 and 2017 was studied. As a 

result, was identified that the size and profitability of the club 

determine the provisions and contingencies, and how much 

the larger the club, the higher the amounts of provisions and 

contingent liabilities. The most profitable clubs, on the other 

hand, as they assume a lower amount of debt, also have a 

lower amount of contingencies (B. O. Cunha et al., 2020). 

The level of disclosure of provisions and contingent 

liabilities in Brazilian football clubs was verified between 

2014 and 2018 to the top 20 of the CBF club ranking in 2019 

who have published their Financial Statements in the period. 

The results indicate that there is no conformity in the quality 

of disclosure of provisions and contingent liabilities for most 

clubs, although this has been improving over the years 

(Lucena & Correia, 2019).  

This study differs from others because it described 

and analyzed liabilities of clubs, it includes provisions for 

contingencies, without focusing on what determines their 

values or their disclosure, but rather on showing the profile 

of present and future obligations. 

 

3 METHODOLOGY 

 

A sample of 20 football clubs in the First and Second 

Divisions of the Brazilian Championship of 2017 and that 

presented the financial statements for the fiscal years 2011 

to 2018 were selected.  

The financial data were collected in the Balance 

Sheet for the fiscal years 2010 to 2018 for the sample and 

updated by the Accumulated Consumer Price Index (IPCA). 

It is noteworthy that, although the statements were raised 

from 2011, the year 2010 was used for the analysis because 

it was presented in the 2011 comparison. In addition, the 

data were also collected from the most recent balance 

sheet. For example, from the balance sheet of 2018, the 

liabilities of 2017 were raised and so on. It is worth 

mentioning that the same criterion was applied to the 

explanatory notes. This choice was made due to the 

verification of re-statements and restatements of balance 

sheets. 

Initially the balance sheets of the clubs were analyzed 

in relation to their liabilities and provisions. The equity 

accounts of the liabilities were standardized according to the 

Accounting Manual for Sports Entities (APFUT, 2017). This 

unification allowed comparability in the analysis between 

entities, providing greater understanding of how the bonds 

are composed. In order to carry out this procedure, the 

content of the explanatory notes was observed, so when the 

accounts presented information from several other accounts 

in the standardized balance sheet, the items were 

considered separately so that the best reallocation could be 

made. When the account presented in the balance sheet did 

not have the respective explanatory note, the amount was 

allocated according to the relevant amount in the original 

statement, which in some cases was not clear, requiring 

arbitration. In addition, at certain times the explanatory note 

was not clear, creating doubt as to the reallocations, which 

were made based on own judgment. 

As an example, the account “Tax and Labor 

Obligations” thus presented by many clubs, the note and the 

values separated according to the definitions of “Taxes and 

Social Contributions” and “Labor and Social Obligations” 

proposed by APFUT (2017). It should also be noted that 

“Revenues to be Appropriated” were found for São Paulo 

Futebol Clube as asset-reducing accounts from 2011 to 

2013, which fit the concepts of “Miscellaneous Advances”. 

Therefore, it was decided to bring these revenues into 

liabilities, as other clubs do. However, it is noteworthy that 

the explanatory notes presented by the clubs were often not 

clear and informative, making it difficult to interpret and 

reallocate the values in the standardized liability, considered 

the main limitation in the study. 

From the standardization, a qualitative analysis of the 

data was carried out. First, the number of accounts 

presented in the original balance sheets was identified. 

Then, a descriptive statistic was performed to summarize 

the club's liability data and present an overview of the area 

in the analyzed period. The objective was to identify the 

central points of the clubs' debts and their variations in the 

analyzed period. Also, the composition and evolution of 

liabilities was verified through vertical and horizontal 

analyzes together with the indicators of capital structure and 

indebtedness Table 1, to present a pattern of the clubs' 

debts and their behavior over the years. 

 

Table 1 

Capital structure and debt indicators used in the analysis. 

Index Measurement 

General 
Indebtedness 

(GI) 

𝐂𝐮𝐫𝐫𝐞𝐧𝐭 𝐋𝐢𝐚𝐛𝐢𝐥𝐢𝐭𝐢𝐞𝐬 + 𝐍𝐨𝐧𝐜𝐮𝐫𝐫𝐞𝐧𝐭 𝐋𝐢𝐚𝐛𝐢𝐥𝐢𝐭𝐢𝐞𝐬 

𝐓𝐨𝐭𝐚𝐥 𝐀𝐬𝐬𝐞𝐭𝐬
 

Short-term 
debt 

composition 
(STDC) 

𝐂𝐮𝐫𝐫𝐞𝐧𝐭 𝐋𝐢𝐚𝐛𝐢𝐥𝐢𝐭𝐢𝐞𝐬

𝐓𝐨𝐭𝐚𝐥 𝐋𝐢𝐚𝐛𝐢𝐥𝐢𝐭𝐢𝐞𝐬
 

Long-term 
debt 

composition 
(LTDC) 

𝐍𝐨𝐧𝐜𝐮𝐫𝐫𝐞𝐧𝐭 𝐋𝐢𝐚𝐛𝐢𝐥𝐢𝐭𝐢𝐞𝐬

𝐓𝐨𝐭𝐚𝐥 𝐋𝐢𝐚𝐛𝐢𝐥𝐢𝐭𝐢𝐞𝐬
 

Source: Dantas et al. (2015). 

Note: in percentage. 
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Also, the liabilities were divided into financial, fiscal 

and operational indebtedness, according to a Table 2. About 

contingencies, in this study, those classified as probable 

loss were assessed, the provisions, classified as club 

liabilities were analyzed. It was initially identified whether the 

clubs declared them in their balance sheets and explanatory 

notes. From the information provided in the explanatory 

notes, both provisions and contingencies were classified 

according to their nature, in (i) tax; (ii) labor; (iii) civil 

proceedings; and, (iv) others, considering only those that 

comply with the requirement of recognizing the risk of, 

respectively, probable and possible loss for the club. When 

the club did not label this way, the provisions were allocated 

in a fifth type, unclassified. 

 

Table 2 

Financial, fiscal, and operational indebtedness definitions. 

Indebtedness Operationalization Source 

Financial 

It consists of the amounts 
presented, after 

standardization, in the 
“Loans” account 

Brandão 
(2012) and 

Mourão 
(2012) 

Fiscal 

It is composed of the 
values presented, after 
standardization, in the 
account “Taxes and 

Social Contributions” and 
“Parceled Taxes”. 

Brandão 
(2012) and 

Mourão 
(2012) 

Operational 
It consists of amounts not 
classified as financial and 

tax indebtedness. 

Mourão 
(2012) 

Source: Developed by the authors.  
 

A descriptive analysis of the information on the 

liabilities and provisions for contingencies presented by the 

clubs was carried out. Descriptive statistics was used to 

summarize the data and present an overview of the area in 

the analyzed period to identify the central points of the debts 

of the clubs and their variations. The composition and 

evolution of liabilities, provisions and contingencies were 

verified through vertical and horizontal analyzes in 

conjunction with capital and debt structure indicators to 

present a pattern of the debts of the clubs and their behavior 

over the years. 

In relation to provisions, some information was initially 

identified in the statements, classified as (i) the existence of 

the account in the balance sheet; (ii) explanatory note; (iii) 

probability of occurrence; (iv) account movements 

(additions and write-offs); (v) number of disputes 

(lawsuits/administrative processes); and (vi) classification of 

provisions. The main provisions and the frequency with 

which the clubs present them was verified. Descriptive 

analysis was performed together with the descriptive 

statistics about the values. 

Considering the evidence from this study on the 

representativeness of debts for large, insolvent, and 

southern clubs, to complement these results, a median 

difference test was carried out to verify whether there are 

significant differences between the groups' indebtedness. 

Therefore, the non-parametric Two-sample Wilcoxon rank-

sum (Mann-Whitney) test was performed, which has the null 

hypothesis that the distribution of both groups is the same. 

To carry out the test, the values of the indicators 

General Indebtedness, Short and Long-Term Indebtedness 

and the ratio of provisions for contingencies and total 

liabilities were considered. The size, solvency and region 

variables were operationalized as dummies. For large clubs, 

1 was attributed to Clube Atlético Mineiro, Botafogo de 

Futebol e Regatas, Corinthians, Cruzeiro Esporte Clube, 

Clube de Regatas do Flamengo, Fluminense Football Club, 

Grêmio Foot-Ball Porto Alegrense, Internacional, 

Sociedade Esportiva Palmeiras, Santos, São Paulo and 

Clube de Regatas Vasco da Gama (Dantas et al., 2015) and 

zero for the others. For solvent clubs, 1 was assigned to 

clubs with positive equity and zero to those with negative 

equity (Dantas et al., 2015), because this represents one of 

the ways to measure insolvency in football (Beech et al., 

2010; Szymanski, 2017). Regarding the region, 1 was 

attributed to clubs in the Southeast region (America Mineiro, 

Atlético Mineiro, Botafogo, Corinthians, Cruzeiro, 

Flamengo, Fluminense, Palmeiras, Associação Atlética 

Ponte Preta, São Paulo, and Vasco) and zero to the others. 

 

4 ANALYSIS AND DISCUSSION OF RESULTS 

 

4.1 Indebtedness of Brazilian Football Clubs 

Analysis of the financial statements of the 20 football 

clubs resulted in 180 balance sheets for the period between 

2010 and 2018, in which 159 liability accounts were 

identified (current and non-current), resulting in an average 

of 7.95 accounts per club, re-classified among the 13 

accounts proposed by the APFUT. 

 

4.1.1 Findings on liabilities 

The total average amount of debt presented in each 

balance sheet was R$476.23 million, most of which refers 

to non-current liabilities, which represent 62.26% of total 

debt (Table 3). This finding is different from other studies 

(such as  Cunha et al., 2017), who found that short-term 

debt represented the larger part of the debt. Criciúma 

Esporte Clube was the club that disclosed the balance sheet 

with the lowest amount of current liability (R$ 4,54 million, 

2018), and the balance sheet with the lowest total liability 

(R$ 19,983 million, 2010), in contrast to São Paulo, which 

presented the highest amount of debt classified as current 

(R$ 660,19 million, 2012). As for non-current liabilities, the 

Esporte Clube Juventude stands out, with the lowest 

amount of total liabilities (R$ 2,90 million, 2013) and 

Corinthians, which disclosed the balance with the largest 

non-current debt in the period (R$ 1,31 billion, 2012) and the 

highest amount of total liabilities (R$ 1,88 billion, 2012) 

among the 180 balance sheets analyzed. Consequently, it 

is the club with the highest average of the period. 
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Of the 20 clubs, 50% have a total average liability of 

less than R$ 500 million. Between 2012 and 2015, four clubs 

- Botafogo (2), Corinthians (5), Flamengo (4) and São Paulo 

(4) - had total liabilities more than one billion reais. For 

Corinthians and São Paulo this is due to the high value of 

“Miscellaneous Advances”, while for Botafogo and 

Flamengo it is a consequence of the high amount of 

installment taxes. It should be noted that, except for 

Corinthians, the debt of the other clubs was concentrated in 

the long term in all years. While at Corinthians, she started 

to focus on the short term as of 2016, and in 2018 almost 

70% was due until the end of the following year. Such a 

situation can result in liquidity problems if the club does not 

have resources to cover liabilities. 

 

Table 3 

Descriptive statistics of the liabilities of Brazilian football clubs (2010-2018). 

 Minimun 1Q Mean Median 3Q Maximun Standard Deviation Obs. 

Current Liabilities 4,539 36,089 179,728 180,579 275,941 660,189 139,402 180 

Noncurrent Liabilities 2,898 53,262 296,490 235,676 478,093 1,311,467 265,272 180 

Total Liability 19,028 89,787 476,218 488,952 703,694 1,880,747 386,091 180 

Source: Developed by the authors. 

Note. in thousands of reais. 

 

Growth in general indebtedness (GI) and long-term 

debt composition (LTDC) indicates an increase in debt in the 

period, especially in the long term (Figure 1). In addition, 

liabilities registered as ‘long-term’ concentrate the highest 

amounts in relation to total liabilities. It is worth mentioning 

the two periods (2014 and 2015) in which the total liabilities 

was higher than the clubs total assets, causing an 

uncovered liability when all the debts of the 20 clubs were 

added, 11 of them with an average greater than 100% in the 

period. At the beginning of the period, the short and long-

term debt was balanced, and from 2014 on, the long-term 

debt started to have a more relevant proportion. These 

results are still high over the period and indicate financial 

problems. 

 

 
Figure 1. Evolution of average capital structure and debt indicators (2010-2018). 

Source: Developed by the authors. 

Note. GI - General Indebtedness; STDC - Short-term debt composition; LTDC - Long-term debt composition. 

 

For general indebtedness, the results corroborated 

other study (as Dantas et al., 2015), who verified between 

2010 and 2012 rates close to 100%, indicating, in some 

cases, the existence of uncovered liabilities, caused mainly 

by the successive deficits of the clubs (in the period, 102 

deficits were observed, representing 64% of the total of the 

analyzed statements). Results from the work (such as 

Dantas et al., 2017) show the same, with clubs presenting 

liabilities that were superior than their assets over the years. 

In addition, Brazilian clubs had a similar situation to the 

Spanish in 2007 and 2008 (Barajas & Rodríguez, 2010), 

most of which was financed by third-parties, without being 

able to generate resources from their own operation or 

structure. 

This type of funding relying on third parties brings 

great risks, as debt has grown over the years, especially in 

relation to onerous debts such as loans. Although most 

debts are non-current, which would be positive due to the 

longer time to generate funds for settlement, this situation is 

relevant as the equity has diminished. It can be deduced that 

the obligations assumed, in general, do not serve as a 

supplement to equity since internally the clubs have not 

generated funds with their structure. Thus, there are 

situations of clubs contracting a debt to settle others, which 

can lead to financial unsustainability depending on the time 

for settlement of these obligations. 

According to the literature (Myers, 1984), companies 

prefer domestic financing and, when the outflow is to raise 

funds with third parties, seek safer debts first. For the 
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authors, there is no balance between them, only internal and 

external financing. However, these findings demonstrate 

that clubs have opted for external financing and apparently 

have not sought out safe debts. The findings provide 

evidence that for these institutions the Pecking Order theory 

may not apply, corroborating other study (Dantas et al., 

2017).  

 

 

4.1.2 Current and non-current liability: evolution and 

composition 

Initially, while there was a growth of liabilities of 

30.17% from 2010 to 2018, the opposite was identified for 

equity, which decreased by 87.07%. Although the value of 

the equity remained positive at the end of the period, three 

periods with uncovered liabilities were verified, the lowest 

value found in 2014 (Figure 2).  

 
Figure 2. Evolution of liabilities and net worth of Brazilian football clubs (2010-2018) 

Source: Developed by the authors. 

 

The considerable increase in the indebtedness of 

Brazilian clubs is corroborated Brandão (2012) and Dantas 

et al. (2017) and this phenomenon is not exclusive to Brazil. 

Was identified (by Barajas & Rodríguez, 2010; Mourão, 

2012) that the Spanish and Portuguese clubs, respectively, 

spent more than they made in revenues, a similar situation 

to what was verified in Brazil. Brazilian clubs, especially in 

2016, obtained record revenues, but presented a growth in 

total debts and deficits in their results. This indicates that 

clubs are being financed more from third party resources 

than from the revenues generated by their own operation 

and structure, therefore producing more debt. This situation 

is corroborates the literature (Cunha et al., 2017; Dantas et 

al., 2016; Proni & Zaia, 2014). Other findings (Grafietti et al., 

2017) corroborate these results as it was possible to 

observe, for both samples, that the total value of the 

liabilities of 2016 remained practically stable. 

The study resulted that the values that most impact 

on the liabilities are “Miscellaneous Advances”, “Accounts 

Payable/Suppliers/Various Creditors”, “Loans” and “Taxes 

in installments”, in this order. In addition, they had a 

participation in total liabilities of more than 10% at least one 

of the analyzed years. From 2011 to 2015, the 

“Miscellaneous Advances” account was the most 

representative of the club's obligations, without considering 

“Prepaid Revenues”. In 2012, together, they represent for 

about 35% of the clubs' liabilities. However, as of 2016 this 

representativeness reduced to close to 22% and in 2018 it 

did not exceed 20%. However, they are values that attract 

attention in the clubs, because the literature shows that 

clubs rely mainly on revenues from television broadcasting 

rights and sponsorships (Costa & Marinho, 2005; Dantas et 

al., 2015; Dantas & Boente, 2011; Gonçalves & Carvalho, 

2006; Rezende & Custódio, 2012). Thus, the club commits 

to contracts on broadcasting rights, for example, for future 

seasons, without even knowing if it will continue to compete 

for a specific Division or tournament. One of the factors of 

insolvency pointed out (by Beech et al., 2010) is when clubs 

are relegated to a lower division and are not able to manage 

the reduction of revenues in the budget. 

In this context, Brazilian clubs usually invest at the 

beginning of the season to set up competitive teams 

capable of winning the main competitions they play. 

However, efficiency is not guaranteed and there is a 

possibility that at the end of the season the club has not won 

a title or has been relegated to a lower division. When that 

happens, the budget for the next season is compromised. 

Thus, it is understood that the situation of the clubs becomes 

complicated because they are using future resources to 

develop their present activities and poor management of 

resources can jeopardize the execution of these contracts. 

The fiscal, financial and operating indebtedness 

increased for Brazilians, opposite to the Spanish clubs, in 

which the growth of the fiscal indebtedness and the 

reduction of the financial was identified (Barajas & 

Rodríguez, 2010). In addition, this study detected a 45% 

growth in operational growth indebtedness, although it has 

been decreasing since 2015 (Figure 3). This may indicate 
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that, while Europeans sought other sources of funding, 

Brazilians opted to finance themselves, generally, with loans 

from banks, raising the debt not only by the principal amount 

but also by the aggregate interests. It should be noted that 

despite the growth of debt in the period, which reached the 

highest value of the historical series in 2012, they have been 

reducing since then and non-current liabilities are almost 

reaching the initial value.

 

 
Figure 3. Evolution of club indebtedness (2010-2018). 

Source: Developed by the authors. 

 

4.1.2.1 Reports on uncovered liabilities  

In the historical analysis, the aggregate liabilities of 

the 20 teams were higher than the assets in two years (2014 

and 2015), denoting a situation of uncovered liabilities. 

Between 2010 and 2018, the clubs’ equity decreased by 

87.59%. 

Table 4 shows the total of balance sheets with 

identified uncovered liabilities.

 

Table 4 

Rate of balance sheets with uncovered liabilities (2010-2018). 

 2010 2011 2012 2013 2014 2015 2016 2017 2018 Total 

Number of Balance Sheets 20 20 20 20 20 20 20 20 20 180 

Number of Negative Equity 8 6 7 8 10 11 10 9 10 79 

% Negative Equity 40% 30% 35% 40% 50% 55% 50% 45% 50% 44% 

Source: Developed by the authors. 

 

The number of balance sheets with uncovered 

liabilities has increased reaching, and in 2015, one in every 

two clubs presented deficit. Since 2014 since 2014 the 

number of clubs in this situation has remained almost the 

same. There were four clubs that had negative equity values 

in all years researched (Botafogo, Fluminense, Goiás 

Esporte Clube and Vasco). On the contrary, América 

Futebol Clube Minas Gerais, Clube Athletico Paranense, 

Atlético Mineiro, Criciúma, Internacional and São Paulo, did 

not have debts higher than their assets in the period. Data 

show that 70% of the 20 clubs studied presented a deficit in 

at least one balance sheet and is a situation also found other 

studies (Dantas et al., 2015, 2016). 

It is noteworthy that the situation of the clubs in Rio 

de Janeiro is problematic, three out of the four clubs of the 

sample located in Rio de Janeiro present deficit (Botafogo, 

Fluminense and Vasco). Studies (such as Brandão, 2012; 

Proni & Zaia, 2014) found that four football teams located in 

Rio de Janeiro were the ones with the largest debts in their 

studies. Nevertheless, this situation may be directly related 

to the economic problems faced by the state of Rio de 

Janeiro. 

In general, the high number of clubs reporting 

uncovered liabilities in their balance sheets is a relevant 

issue. In some cases, even if all assets of the team were 

liquidated, they would still not be able to cover all their 

obligations. Therefore, the situation of the organizations is 

critical, as they are unsustainable, few of them have 

prospects for reversing the scenario and measures to 

change this scenario are not observed.  

 

4.2 Provisions for contingencies 

Of the 180 balance sheets analyzed, only 13 did not 

present provisions for contingencies in the period. Cruzeiro 

did not provide information on the provisions between 2010 

and 2016. Although it does not present them, there is a note 

clarifying that there are no provisions since 2013 as they 

have no lawsuits considered as possible loss. On the other 

hand, Avaí Futebol Clube started to do so only from 2013, 

while América Mineiro and Coritiba Foot Ball Club only did 

not present them in 2010. Furthermore, only in 2017 did all 
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clubs start to present an account entitled “provisions for 

contingencies”.  

 

4.2.1 Findings on provision for contingencies 

Since 2014, all the clubs in the sample have 

presented explanatory notes on provisions for 

contingencies. Of the 180 balance sheets analyzed, 169 

had notes and 92% included provisions for contingencies, 

of which 90 mentioned that these provisions were based on 

lawsuits the club considers as probable losses. 

Coritiba (since 2014) and Grêmio (all years), 

presented the information on the number of lawsuits they 

are part of. The number of lawsuits presented in the balance 

sheets was of 134 (Grêmio) and 788 (Coritiba), a different 

number to that reported by Mundim (2017) who presented 

for the clubs 154 and 128 labor lawsuits, respectively. In 

addition, the amounts provisioned also differ by Mundim 

(2017) who showing R$ 19.35 million for Grêmio and R$ 

36.71 million for Coritiba, whereas in this work the value was 

higher for both clubs, based on their explanatory notes. 

It was also verified that in 2015 Grêmio presented 

three administrative processes in the Federal Revenue 

Agency. In 2016, the club again mentioned these disputes, 

however, when checking the individual values, there were 

no administrative obligations in the current or comparative 

year. 

The descriptive statistics of provisions for 

contingencies are presented in Table 5. 

 

Table 5 

Descriptive statistics of provisions for contingencies. 

 Minimum 1Q Mean Median 3Q Maximum 
Standard 
Deviation 

Obs 

Labor 33 4,138 16,260 8,690 18,110 136,130 23,382 137 

Taxes 95 3,012 26,798 8,512 27,172 249,065 47,996 49 

Civil 21 1,387 15,954 6,351 21,846 125,927 23,457 124 

Others 1,579 4,648 5,168 5,704 6,367 6,790 1,745 7 

Not classified 0 1,751 10,202 5,466 17,706 37,055 10,730 33 

Total 1,219 7,688 35,280 16,370 36,194 393,200 52,415 167 

Source: Developed by the authors. 

Note. In thousands of reais. 

 

It can be observed that during the nine years, 167 

mentions of provisions for contingencies were found in the 

180 balance sheets analyzed (92.78%), which generated an 

average of R$ 35,40 million in provisions per balance sheet. 

Although presented in greater numbers, labor provisions 

have a lower average than tax. Botafogo presented the 

highest amounts of provisions in 2013 and Figueirense 

Futebol Clube the lowest amounts provisioned in 2011.  

Botafogo presented the highest amounts of provisions, both 

tax and labor, both in 2013. According to the news, the club 

responded in 2017 to lawsuits that accumulated around R$ 

200 million (Mundim, 2017). 

Figueirense, on the other hand, is responsible for the 

highest growth in the provisions, 1002% between 2010 and 

2018, and this situation is due, in sum, to the almost R$ 14 

million increases in labor provisions. It should be noted that 

the club has been facing off-field problems since 2017 when 

its management was transferred to Elephant, culminating in 

W.O. due to the lack of payment of salaries and the 

unilateral termination of the contract between the club and 

the company (Cardoso, 2019). Such a situation may be an 

explanation for the massive increase in contingent labor 

provisions. 

The club with the lowest labor provision is América 

Mineiro (2018) and Palmeiras (2016) represents the lowest 

amount of tax provisions. Regarding civil and other 

provisions, the highest values were presented by Flamengo 

(2012) and Esporte Clube Goiás (2010), while the lowest 

were by Ponte Preta (2018) and Botafogo (2010), 

respectively. About the provisions that have not been 

classified, São Paulo (2018) is responsible for the highest 

amount. It is noteworthy that not classifying the provisions 

decreases the transparency of the information and limits the 

user's knowledge of the types of disputes in which the club 

is involved. 

Another point to highlight is the lower value of 

provisions that were not classified, presented by América 

Futebol Clube. This club did not present any changes in 

additions or reductions in the contingency provisions 

account in the explanatory notes, and the value remained 

the same from 2011 to 2014. This situation was also verified 

for Avaí Futebol Clube, Figueirense, Atlético Mineiro, 

Flamengo, Fluminense, Goiás, Palmeiras, Ponte Preta and 

Vasco. The fact that draws attention in these cases is that 

the provisions remain for a long time without any additional 

information or update, and it is not possible to determine the 

causes for this. It is possible that the club has not given 

updates because it has not monitored the dispute, or it has 

not undergone any changes over the years. However, the 

teams do not mention why the provisions have not 

undergone any changes over the years. 

 

4.2.2 Provision for contingencies: evolution and 

composition 

During the nine years studied, it was possible to see 

that the most frequent was the labor provision, followed by 

the civil and tributary. This group increased by 62% in value 

in the period. A plausible justification is the possibility that 
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athletes have, due Art, 31 of the Pelé Law, to enter the labor 

court requesting the end of the contract, which occurs when 

salaries are delayed at least three months. In this case, the 

club receives an order to terminate the contract, but labor 

costs are still discussed (Kampff, 2019). 

It is noted that, in general, the frequency of mention 

of the types of provisions has been constant since 2012, 

mainly the labor ones. Figure 4 shows how often clubs 

present each type of provision.  

 
Figure 4. Frequency of presentation of provisions for contingencies. 

Source: Developed by the authors. 

 

Labor provisions are presented practically by all the 

clubs and denote, for the most part, legal obligations related 

to labor or image rights. In 2018, the updated figures 

represented R $ 360 million and an increase of 62% in 

relation to 2010. Tax provisions have reduced not only in 

terms of classification, but also in value. This was the type 

that more reduced in the period, about 57% compared to 

2010. Here, some points should be highlighted. In the 

analyzed period, there were two specifics governmental 

installments for the tax debts of the clubs with the Federal 

Government, Timemania and PROFUT. With this possibility, 

the clubs assumed obligations with a payment schedule, 

making them classifiable as “Installments Taxes” and no 

longer as a provision, for example, because they would 

correspond to present obligations with a certain amount and 

term for payments. In addition, in 2018 the Federal 

Government launched the Special Tax Regularization 

Program (PERT) to which the clubs also benefited, as 

shown in the explanatory notes. In other words, the 

possibility to be raised is that with the installments of 

Timemania, PERT and PROFUT, the judicial disputes 

regarding fiscal debts culminated in agreed installments, 

becoming a de facto obligation.  An example of this is 

observed with Botafogo. 

Regarding the classification ‘others’, there are 

administrative provisions presented by Goiás, that disclosed 

them until 2015. However, in 2016 there was no value in this 

item, nor in the comparison with 2015. The note did not 

mention the reason for the amount to have been written off, 

either by loss, change of probability or extinction of the 

process. However, when comparing the values, it was 

verified that in 2016 they were classified as related to tax 

and not as administrative. What is seen, therefore, is the 

lack of uniformity in the items used, as well as in the 

presentation structure of the notes, not only for Goiás, but 

also for the other clubs in the sample. 

The year with the highest amount provisioned was 

2013, however, since then it has been reducing its total 

value about 26%. In 2018 only Fluminense had a total 

amount provisioned above R$ 100 million. Almost all of 

these total amounts are presented in the noncurrent 

liabilities of the clubs. 

Eight clubs showed a decrease in the value of 

provisions in the period, and the most significant reduction 

observed was for Atlético Mineiro. Of the 12 clubs that 

presented growth in the value of provisions, in seven of them 

the evolution rate was superior to 100%, with Figueirense 

and São Paulo increasing by more than 500% during the 

period analyzed. 

It should also be noted that there were differences 

between the sum of provisions and the balance of the 

account in the explanatory note and in the balance sheet. 

The total of these differences is R$ 200,198, considering the 

information from Atlético Mineiro (2014), Athletico 

Paranaense (2014), Botafogo (2012), Flamengo (2014) and 

Goiás (2011). Although the total provisions presented in the 

explanatory notes were the same as those in the balance 

sheets of these clubs, when the individual values of the 

cases were added, the results found were different. 

Regarding Avaí, the account “provisions for contingencies” 

totals are presented in the Balance Sheet as civil lawsuits, 

whereas the R$ 7.3 million described as labor claims are not 

clearly detailed in the balance sheet. In addition, the note 

states that both are classified by the club's legal department 

as a possible occurrence, therefore, they should not be 

presented in the statement, because these are contingent 

liabilities, according to CPC 25 and ITG 2003. 

The lack of information in notes on provisions is 

particularly interesting. Few are the clubs that detail the 
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provisions they made. The information presented is 

generalized so it is not known, in fact, how many processes 

the clubs are responding to. It was observed that, in some 

cases, the notes only repeated those drafted in previous 

years. In addition, errors were often found in the position of 

the values, since they only appeared to have been pasted 

and the values of the year to which they refer, updated. 

On the other hand, it is important to point out that over 

the years the clubs have presented more information about 

the provisions for contingencies. There is greater detail in 

relation to the initial years analyzed, which can be observed, 

for example, by the increase in the number of provisions 

classified among one of the categories studied. However, 

this growth in disclosure does not necessarily reflect quality. 

 

4.3 Indebtedness profile of football clubs in Brazil 

Based on the results, the Figure 5 presents the 

characteristics of indebtedness and provisions of Brazilian 

clubs. 

  

 
Figure 5. Debt characteristics of Brazilian football clubs. 

Source: Developed by the authors. 

 

Figure 5 shows that clubs have raised funds from 

third parties to pay other debts, which are often overdue and 

usually come in the form of anticipation of funds. In other 

words, the teams have advanced amounts to receive, in 

general, transmission rights, to settle current obligations, 

compromising future budgets. In addition, there is a relevant 

growth in indebtedness, being even greater for provisions, 

especially those arising from labor claims. 

Additionally, it was found that the big clubs, those 

insolvent and those located in the Southeast region have a 

higher debt. The sports literature points out that in soccer 

clubs, those considered large tend to have higher 

indebtedness, although the risk of insolvency is greater for 

small clubs (Baroncelli & Lago, 2006; Dantas et al., 2015; 

Ferri et al., 2017; Hagen & Cunha, 2019; Plumley et al., 

2021). Table 6 presents the results of the Two-sample 

Wilcoxon rank-sum (Mann-Whitney) test to verify if there are 

significant differences in the debts of clubs with these 

characteristics. 

 

Table 6 

Results of Two-sample Wilcoxon rank-sum (Mann-Whitney) test 

 
General 

Indebtedness 

Short and 

long-term debt 

composition 

Provisions/ 

General 

Indebtedness 

Size 
Prob > |z| =   

0.0000 

Prob > |z| =   

0.6464 

Prob > |z| =   

0.0000 

Solvency 
Prob > |z| =   

0.2720 

Prob > |z| =   

0.5957 

Prob > |z| =   

0.1992 

Region 
Prob > |z| =   

0.0000 

Prob > |z| =   

0.0259 

Prob > |z| =   

0.0000 

Source: Developed by the authors. 

 

As 𝑃𝑟𝑜𝑏>𝑧 less than 0.05, the results presented in 

Table 6 indicate that, at a 5% level of significance, there is 

a difference between the general indebtedness of large and 

small clubs, as well as for the proportion of provisions in 

relation to the total debts. In this sample, no significant 

difference was found in the debts of solvent and insolvent 

clubs, although almost 50% of the balances presented 

negative equity in the period. Regarding the region, there 

are differences between clubs in the Southeast region and 

the others for all analyzed variables. 

These results can indicate that the size of the club 

and the region where it is located can explain the 

indebtedness levels of teams in Brazil. However, it is 

noteworthy that the teams considered as large in this study 

are located predominantly in the Southeast region, except 

for Internacional and Grêmio. When looking at the gross 

values, the debt of big clubs is almost six times greater than 

that of small ones, reducing to three times when analyzing 

the region. 

 

5 CONCLUSIONS 

 

Given the increase in the debt of Brazilian football 

clubs and considering that these values may be even 

higher, since some may not be fully computed in the entities’ 

liabilities, this study aimed to describe the debt profile of 

Brazilian football clubs. Analysis was carried out on 20 clubs 

participating in the First and Second Divisions of the 

Brazilian Championship of 2017, which presented, during 

the period of 2010 to 2018, the complete set of financial 

statements. 

It was identified that the debt grows over the years, 

corroborating the studies of Brandão (2012) and Dantas et 

al. (2017). The results indicate that clubs cannot sustain 

themselves with their own resources and often need to raise 

funds from third parties, in the form of loans or government 

benefits. In addition, it was found beyond the reduction to 

the net equity, that almost 50% of the balance sheets 

analyzed presented a situation of uncovered liabilities. 

These results indicate that the clubs, for the most part, are 

increasingly financing themselves with third party resources 

General Information

•Average debt: R$ 485 
million per balance and R$ 

9.5 billion per year.
•33% growth between 2010 

and 2018.

Composition

•Long-term debt.

Financing

•Third party capital.
•Debts contracted to pay 

debts already due.
•Source of resources: 

Miscellaneous advances.

Provisions

•Average value per balance: 
R$ 35 million.

•62% growt between 2010 
and 2018.

•Main origin is labor.
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and need alertness, as part depends on attracting costly 

resources, such as loans and financing. 

When compared with data from literature, the 

indebtedness of Brazilian clubs grew by around 70% 

between 2008 and 2018, but the proportion of fiscal debts, 

which at that date was almost 50%, in 2018 were around 

35%. Although, debts with the government have reduced, it 

is not possible to say that the clubs are paying them, 

because in 2015, most teams managed to pay in 

installments and remission part of the debts with the 

government from PROFUT. Furthermore, the proportion 

may have been reduced because other obligations such as 

loans and labor debts may have increased significantly. 

Thus, it is possible that the Government's own attempt to 

assist the clubs has not been successful, as was the case 

with Timemania and pointed out by literature (such as Proni 

& Zaia, 2014). 

This situation leads to problems of financial balance, 

with clubs showing high and consecutive deficits. In other 

companies, if it were continuously presented, they would 

have declared bankruptcy, which is not the case with clubs. 

The teams, even in this situation, making new transactions, 

to make the teams competitive, without worrying about 

unsustainability that permeates them using more and more 

third-party resources, entering an unsustainable financial 

cycle. The conclusion is that in Brazil the football seems to 

be unsustainable, not the sport, but when it comes to its 

management. This situation is similar to others presented by 

football clubs in other countries a few years ago, such as 

Spain (Barajas & Rodríguez, 2010). The difficult economic 

and financial situation of  Brazilian clubs is due, in short, to 

the lack of management and control mechanisms (Rezende 

& Dalmácio, 2015). 

It is also noteworthy that this study aimed to identify 

the liabilities of Brazilian football clubs in order to present 

the indebtedness of these teams, however, other aspects 

stood out and not only the debt, which is significant, but 

presented small signs of reduction. First, attention is drawn 

to the indications of a lack of quality in the structure and 

presentation of the financial statements. In addition to the 

disclosure being often in low quality files, there are errors in 

values and evidence that clubs are just trying to comply with 

disclosure requirements, without paying attention to issues 

of reliability, comprehensibility and comparability of the 

accounting information disclosed. The repetition of values 

from one year to the next, as it does not happen once in a 

while and in a few clubs, makes us question the intention of 

disclosure. 

In addition, it was also verified that part of the clubs, 

subject to PROFUT and, therefore, to the Accounting 

Manual for Sports Entities, does not adopt the standardized 

statements according to that manual. In fact, in some clubs, 

there is no standardization even between one balance sheet 

and another, which makes understanding and comparisons 

difficult, so that the standardization performed in this study 

is reduced, as many values are mixed between the 

accounts, without proper explanation. complementary via 

explanatory note. Thus, more than demonstrating how, how 

much and to whom Brazilian clubs owe, this study 

contributes to drawing the attention of those responsible for 

preparing the financial statements of Brazilian clubs, 

auditors and supervisors to the need for intense monitoring 

and zeal for data disclosed. Well, credible accounting 

information can attract investors and assist clubs in their 

economic and financial restructuring, without spending 

years depending on government measures.  

Based on these results, this study suggests policies 

that can be adopted to make Brazilian football viable in the 

long term and mitigate the financial difficulties faced by 

clubs. First, the redistribution of broadcasting rights in a 

more equitable and limited a cost-cutting to improve 

competitiveness and reduce the clubs' financial risk. 

Second, the establishment of a salary cap, which in Brazil 

could be related to the division, as it tends to help clubs 

maintain costs. Finally, those responsible for organizing 

football should review the financial regulations to provide 

greater consistency to help clubs achieve long-term 

financial sustainability (Plumley et al., 2021). 

Regarding the limitations, there is a lack of the 

complete set of financial statements for the period studied, 

which reduced the sample analyzed and prevented to 

include a larger number of clubs. Also noteworthy is the lack 

of clarity in the explanatory notes that often made it difficult 

to understand the standardization of accounts, as well as 

bringing subjectivity to judge the reallocation of the 

explanatory notes in the best possible way. However, 

although the quality of the information publicized by the 

clubs is challenged, it is better to study using what is 

available than being deprived of understanding how the 

football business works (Barajas & Rodríguez, 2010). 

Finally, the Brazilian football clubs must publish the 

Financial Statements prepared in accordance with Law nº. 

6.404/76 and other rules issued by the Conselho Federal de 

Contabilidade since 2003. In addition, since 2015 clubs who 

joined PROFUT must publish their Financial Statements on 

their website after being audited and approved by the Fiscal 

and Deliberative Boards. For the teams who are in the 

PROFUT, the non-compliance with the publication of the 

statements and the other provisions of Law nº. 13.155/15, 

leeds to club exclusion and with the debt immediately 

demanded. 
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